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Dear,

| am writing in response to your enquiry under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA)
reference FOI/18/11/03.

You requested the following information, please also see our response below:

1. How much does it cost in pounds sterling to recruit one doctor from an EEA country, as of
October 2018?
The Trust has not, to date, recruited doctors from the EEA

2. How much does it cost in pounds sterling to recruit one nurse from an EEA country, as of
October 2018?
Unfortunately, we do not hold this information

3. How much did it cost in pounds sterling to recruit one doctor from an EEA country in
October 2015?
N/A

4. How much did it cost in pounds sterling to recruit one nurse from an EEA country in
October 20157
Unfortunately we do not hold this information

5. How much of the overall budget is dedicated to recruitment?
£647,516

6. How much did you spend on medicines from the EEA in 2015?
£588,837

7. How much are you projecting to spend on medicines from the EEA in 20187
£537,364

8. What percentage of medication came from the EEA in 2015?
We procure all our medicines from licensed wholesale suppliers based in the UK. We are therefore
not able to answer what percentage come from EEA as we get them direct from UK supplier

9. What percentage of medication came from the EEA in 2018?
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As above

I hope you find this information of some assistance.

If for any reason you are dissatisfied with our response, kindly in the first instance contact Caroline
Smart, Information Governance Lead via the following email address:

FOl@secamb.nhs.uk

Yours sincerely

Freedom of Information Coordinator
South East Coast Ambulance Service NHS Foundation Trust
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